
Subject: Re: Es�mate for Public No�ce_71534851
From: "Carol A. Overland" <overland@legalectric.org>
Date: 10/3/2025, 9:39 AM
To: Legals <legals@pioneerpress.com>

THANK YOU for your quick response.

I will want to proceed, but not un�l later in the month. Run date NOT Tuesday, October 7! I'm lining things up ahead of �me as we're
leaving for a month in Norway, and I'll be ini�a�ng this thousands of miles away. Please hold onto this -- I expect it'll be the 3rd or 4th
week of October. I'll contact you with payment info before publica�on.

Again, THANK YOU! It's in my file, in my backpack, and hope TSA won't find it too threatening!!

Carol

On 10/3/2025 8:51 AM, Legals wrote:

Hello Carol,
Thank you for your email.  The notice is scheduled as indicated below along with the proof and quote for your
approval.  
Please take a look, call me with a credit card payment information if you would like to proceed with the ad.  
If you do not wish to proceed with the ad, let me know and I will cancel the notice.
Payment is due before Noon on Monday for the notices to publish on Tuesday.
We can publish tomorrow too, if you need to.  Deadline payment and approval is tomorrow is Noon today.

Please provide Billing Information below to setup an account if you are proceeding with the ad.
Company Name
Contact Name: 
Billing Address:
Contact Phone: 

We will email you the Affidavit after the ad is published.

Total cost:  $334.70
Run date(s):  Tues, 10/7/25
Ad Placement:  Legal Notice
Account:  Quote
Ad size:  1 col x 71 lines
Ad ref #:  71534851

Ad proof:





Thank you.

True Lee 

Pioneer Press

One West Water Street, #200, Saint Paul, MN 55107

True: 651-228-2166

Kayla: 651-228-5053

legals@pioneerpress.com

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

PUBLICATION DEADLINES:

Mon publica�on, deadline is Friday at 5pm

Tue publica�on, deadline is Mon at 1pm

Wed publica�on, deadline is Tue 1pm

Thu publica�on, deadline is Wed at 1pm

Fri publica�on, deadline is Thu at 1pm

Sat publica�on, deadline is Friday at Noon.

Sun publica�on, deadline is Thursday at 5pm.

On Thu, Oct 2, 2025 at 5:32 PM Carol A. Overland <overland@legalectric.org> wrote:
A�ached in word - doesn't need a heading

Looking for es�mate (ball park, considering the $4.70/line.

THANKS!!!

Carol

--

"Our lives begin to end the day we become silent
about the things that ma�er."  Dr. Mar�n Luther King, Jr.
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